Highland City
Comprehensive Fee Schedule
Fiscal Year 2024

Va.s4di

HIGHLAND CITY

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Building Permit, Impact Fees, Miscellaneous Fees

Building Permits

Lot Infrastructure Bond (including but not limited to sidewalk, curb, pavement, meter boxes)
..................................................................................................................................... $4,000.00
*For lots accessed by private roads, bond amount and type may be adjusted with approval of
building official and public works director or designees commensurate with measure of risk to
public infrastructure.

Permit Fee ....ooooiiiiiiiiiei e As set forth in the International Building Code
Plan Check Fee ....cccoooiiiiiiiiiiiciiiiiiiceeeee, As set forth in the International Building Code
ReINSPECtION FFEE ....ooeveeiiee s $100.00
Same-day Inspection Cancellation Fee ...........ccccciiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiici e $65.00
S01AT VAIUATION ...iivniiiiiiie et ettt et e e et e e eaeenanaes $2.76 per watt
SEALE TAX weuiiieiiiiieieee e eeaaaas 1% of total building permit fee

Building Permit Deposits

Accessory Structure, Solar, Remodel, Addition, or Basement..........ccc..cooovviiiiiieeniiiinnnnnnn. $45.00
(0703100101 L AT | T TR UTTRRPPR $500.00
5 (o) 00 L= SRRSO PP OPPR PRI $500.00
SWIMMING POOL...ooiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee et et e e e e e et e e e e e e e eer s $100.00

Commercial Impact Fees
Fee schedule as set forth by current impact fee study

Residential Impact Fees
Single Family

Culinary Water Impact Fee (SOUtheast) .......cccccccviiiiuiuiiiiiiii e $603.00
Parks (before August 14, 2023) ......ccouiiuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e e e e e e $5,854.00
Parks (after August 14, 2023) ...ccooiiiiiiiiiiee e $6,301.00
Pressurized Irrigation .........cccoeeeeiiiiiiiiiienneen.n. $0.51 per square foot of permeable surface of lot
Public Safety
POLICE ettt ettt e e aanas $245.02
e o ettt ettt et aaaas $515.67
ROAAS ettt ettt et $538.00
SEWET PET RO oottt aaaaaaes
CONETAL ettt a e $1,581.00
SOUBREAST .iiveiiiie ettt e et e et e et s et e e ta e et s e taeeeaneesaeeeas $2,773.00
Timpanogos Special Service DIStIICt ....occeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeiiiieiiceee e e $4,981.00

Multi Family

Culinary Water Impact Fee (SOUtheast) ........oooovviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieec e $603.00
Parks (before August 14, 2023) ......ccouuiuiieiieiiiiiiiiiiiiee et e e e e e e e e e e e e s $4,804.00
Parks (after August 14, 20238) ...ccooiiiiiiiiiiieeee e $4904.00
Pressurized Irrigation ........cccoeeeeeiivveiiiieeennenn... $0.51 per square foot of permeable surface of lot

Public Safety

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



POLICE ettt ettt e et eras $138.05

< YRR $409.05
Roads

Attached 6-8 UNItS PEY ACTE ....coevvueiiiiiiee e e $328.00-$376.00

Senior Restricted HOUSING........oouuiiiiiiiiiiicie e $194.00
Sewer per ERC

CnNtTAL oo s $1,581.00

N Lo DR o V<Y 1<) AT $2,773.00
Timpanogos Special Service DIStIICE ...oooeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeiiieeieee e $4,981.00

Miscellaneous Fees

Culinary Water Meter

ReSIANTIAL /4 TNICH vt ettt e et e et e et e et e e e e e taeeeanas $567.71
CommMETCIAL 1 1/2 INCH «.u ettt e et e et e e taee e e e s et eeans $938.12
COomMIMETCIAL 2 INCH ... ettt ettt e e e et e et s e e s e vaeeeanas $1,152.92
Flat Lid Meter UDPGIade ....uuuueeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee ettt e e et e e e e e e e et eeeeaaaees $47.20
Infrastructure Reimbursement (only applicable to the subdivisions listed below)

SKYE ESTALES ..iiiiiiiiiiiicii e e e e e e e et aaaaaaes $390.00

Highland Oaks .....ooouuiiiiiiiiicce et e e e e e e e e e et e e e aaaeees $627.00
Pressurized Irrigation Meter
BT ¥ o Vel « H RPN $467.46
Y] o $532.85
R 1 c) o HO PO URRRR SRRt $2,616.61
QUITICK Leuei it e et eeea et aeeaaeerr— i ———_ $2,905.73
B s 1)« NPT $3,403.92
L o Vel o NPT PRPPRRTPRN $5,229.23
SEWES CONNECTION FEE it eee e e e e e e eeeenaanes $500.00
SWPP Inspection
SINGLE FAIMILY....oiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e et e e e e e e e aaaaaa, $1,500.00
Multi Family (Attached Dwelling Units).......cccooeeeeeeeininnnns $50.00 per unit, $1,500.00 minimum
Subdivisions & Other Developments .......coeevviiiiiiiiiiiiiieeieeeeeeee e $2,500.00

Business Licensing & Solicitors

Commercial Business Licenses

Business License Filing Fee (unless specifically noted below)............ccveeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeennnnnnn, $90.00
Business Renewal Fee (unless specifically noted below) ......ccooeeeiiiiiiiiiiiieeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeee, $60.00
Auto Repair/MechaniCal.............uiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e e e e $230.00
AUto Repair/Painting.........coooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeciee e e e e e e e ea e $300.00
Mobile Paint ServiCES .......cccciiiiiiiiiiieeie e $230.00
Gasoline/Propane Dispensing (2as StatlOons)..........ceeeeieeeiieeiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeriiiiiieeeeeeeeeerrrrinees $230.00
DIy CLEAMEES ...covviiiiiiieeeieeeeeie ettt et tee e e e e e e e e e et e e e e eeeeeesaab e e eeeeeserrrsrannnes $160.00
Large Retall (GrOCeIY STOTES) ......uueiiiieiiieiiiiiiiee ettt e e e e e et eeeeaaanes $300.00
TODACCO-SIMOKE SHOP .evvviiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeee et e e e e e e et eeeeeeeeeeat e eeeeaeees $275.00
Secondhand Dealers
PaAWIIDTOKETS ..ot ettt e et $325.00
3

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Used/EXChanges/Con .........uuuuieiiiieiiiieiiiiiee et e e et ee e e e e e e e e beeeeeeeeeeeensaaas $175.00

Hotel/Motel/RoomINg HOUSE.......ccooiiveiiiiieeiieieieeeeee et e e e e $375.00
Short-term Rentals....ccoovveiiiii et e e e eeaas $90.00
Fireworks - Indoor Sales/Outdoor SAles ... $225.00
|5 o1y o =1 £ U $300.00
Private Clubs W/LLIQUOT LICEIISE ....uuuiiiiiiieiiiiee e e eeeees $420.00
Wholesale/Bulk Ol DiSPensSing........uucceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeiiieeeeeeeeeeeevarieeeeeeeeeeeraaraaeeeaaaaees $300.00
MINETAL EXETACTION ettt e e e aaas $400.00
Hazardous Materials

SEOTAZE OMNLY .evniiiiiiiiiiiccie ettt e e et e e e e e e e e aaaaaes $230.00

Mixing/DiSPensiNg/USE . ......uuuueeeiieeiiiieiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeceee e e et eeee e e e e e e e e reeeeeeeeeeeraraaes $300.00

] 25 = OO UUPPPRUPPRN $375.00
Home Occupation Licenses
Filing Fees
Home Occupation (unless specifically noted below) ...........ccvveeeeiiiiiiieeiiieeeeieiiiiiiiiiieeeeeennnen, $60.00
Home Occupation with no off-site ImMPaC .........cvvueeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e $0.00
Administrative Fee (printed license for exempt buSINesses) .........ccvvveeeeeeeiieeeeuiiieeeeeeneneenennnn $10.00
Home Daycares, Preschools and Dance Studios ........ccoooiveviiieeieiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeiieeeeeeeeees $90.00
Home Occupation with Hazardous Materials...........cooueiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeee e $90.00
HODDY Breeder ...uuuee it e e e et e e e e e e et aaaaaaes $60.00

Renewal Fees

Home Occupation (unless specifically noted below) ..........ccceeeeeeeeeeeeeeiieiiiiiiieieieieeieeeeeeeeenn $25.00
Home Occupation with no off-site ImMPaCt .........ouvuieiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeee e $0.00
Administrative Fee (printed license for exempt buSINesses) .........ccovveeeeeeeiieeeeiiieeeeeeeeneeennnnn $10.00
Home Daycares, Preschools and Dance Studios ..........ooovvvviiieeieiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeiieeeeeeeeees $60.00
Home Occupation with Hazardous MaterialS......cccccoooiiiiiiiiiiieeiiiiiiiiiiiiieeceeeeeeeeieeeeeeeeees $60.00
|3 00) o) o) =3 =Y=Ye =) NPT RTPUPURRRSRUPRN $25.00

Business License Penalty Late Fees
MONEILY TALE ..vvveiieieiiieeeeee e e 10.00% of renewal fee

Temporary Use Permit
PO INIIE ettt et a . aana $25.00

Business is also required to have a Highland City business license.

Solicitors

Solicitor Fees (Sroup 0f 2 OF IMOTE) ....oovvvvvuieiiiiiiiieeiiieie et ee e e e e e e e s $125.00
SOLLCILOT Fees (SINELE) ...iiiiiiiiiiiiee et e et e e e e e e e e e s $50.00
Miscellaneous

Business License Fire Department Reinspection Fee........cccoooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiic, $100.00
Replacement/additional copy of Business LiCensSe............uuveeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeveiiiieee e $10.00
Cemetery

Burial Plot

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



RESIACIIL oottt $1,210.00

NOD-RESIACIIL ...t e et e e et e e e e vt e e e e aaaaeees $1,690.00
Single Burials

WEEKAAY ..ottt ettt e ettt e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e eaaaaes $600.00
WeeKkend or HOIAAY ....oouueeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e et eeeeeeees $950.00
Double Burials

WEEKAAY ..ceeiiiiiiiee ettt e e e e e et ee e e e e e e e e et eeaeaeeaaarb e aaaaaes $750.00
Weekend or HOIIAAY ....couvuniiiiiiiiicie e e e e e e e e e s $1,150.00
Burials for Cremains and Caskets 36’ or less

WEEKAAY ...oeeiiiiiiiee et e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e e ettt e e e eeaeeeaatb e aaaaaes $500.00
Weekend or HOIAAY ...coouvueiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e e e e e et eeeaeeees $850.00
Disinterment

WEEKAAY .ottt e e et e e e e et e e e e e et aaaaaaes $650.00
Weekend or HOILAAY ....ooouuuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiciie et e e e e e et $1,080.00
Disinterment of Cremains and Caskets 36’ or less

WEEKAAY .ottt e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e aaaaaaes $435.00
WeeKkend or HOIAAY ...ooovvueiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieec et e e e e e et eeeeeaees $755.00

Burial Lot Transfers

Temporary Grave Marker
Bl e $25.00

Headstone Setting Fee
i e ettt t——————— $50.00

Civic Events (Non-Fling Related)

Youth Fishing ResIAdent........cooovviiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiceec e e e e e e e e eeaaaen $30.00
Youth Fishing NOn-Resident.........coeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e $35.00
Fishing Pole Rental..........oouiiiiiiiiiiiiic et e e e e e e $5.00
Movie in the Park SponsorshiD .......uueeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeceeeeeeeeeeee et eeeeaaees $750.00
(017 o=yl DAY 4 = TP PPRRTPRN TBD
Vendors (3 hours)

OO VIO e e e et e et e e e e e e e e e s eeeeeeanas $25.00
Food Vendor Electricity OUtIets..........vveeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeee e $10.00/outlet
NON-FOOA VEIIAOT ... ettt et e e e et e e e e e e e e e s eraeaeeanas $10.00
Non-Food Vendor Electricity OUtletS...coooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiieiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee e $10.00/outlet

Facility Rentals
Building

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Council Chambers, Community Center

RESIACNT ..o $15.00 per hour

JA o) o B0 =t e 1= o X SRR PUSRNPPRPPPRt $30.00 per hour

NON-Profit OrGANIZATION .. ... nnnnnnan $5.00 per hour
This is the only fee non-profits are subject to.

Government OrZANIZATIONS .....ceeieeiiriiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeetitiieeeeeeeeeeeeattiaaeeeeeeeeersrraaaaeeaaaaees $5.00 per hour
This is the only fee governments are subject to.

00 B e $50.00

P1ano USE Fee....uuuuuuii e nnnen $10.00

ProJeCtor @@ ..covviieiiieiiieeee e aaaaes $10.00

Refundable Ro0Om DEPOSIE ....cccoiiiiiiiiiieiiieiiieeeieee et e et eeeaeaees $150.00

Fields

Beacon Hills Lower, Beacon Hills Upper, Lone Peak East, Lone Peak West, Mitchell Hollow,
Wimbleton South, Canterbury PI, Heritage Park, Town Center

Cedar Hills City Recreation League ........cccc..c........ $2 per Highland resident per sports season
Other governmental AZENCIES ..........oovvvriiiiieieeeiiieeeiieeeeeeeee et e e e e e eeeeeaees $5.00 per hour
Portable Toilet Maintenance ......... divided equally between the City and renting organization
Baseball Field MarKing Fee ..........ooouuivieiiiiiiiiieicee et e e e $25.00
Refundable DEePosit .......uuuueeeiiiiiiiiiiceec et eaaaees $150.00
Non-profit entities

P Al Il oo s $5.00 per hour
Competition OF CIINICS........ciiiiiiiiiiiei e e e e et eeeeeeeeaaraees $10.00 per hour
Day Rental.. ... e e e e e e et aaaaaes $75.00
For-profit entities

P A IS o oeeeieiee ettt ettt $15.00 per hour
Competition OF CLINICS........covviiiieeiieeeiiiieeiieee et eee e e e eeeeeeeeeraraes $30.00 per hour
Day Rental.......oovuuiiiiiiiiiiee et $225.00
Pavilion

Highland Glen, Heritage, Town Center Meadows, Merlin B. Larson, and Mitchell Hollow
Resident

Half-Day Rental........ooooviioiiiiiiiieee ettt e e e e e et eeeaeeees $20.00
Full Day Rental .......cooooviiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e e $40.00
Non-resident
Half-Day Rental..........oooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e e e e et $70.00
Full Day Rental .........cooviiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e e e $100.00
Government OrZANIZATIONS ....cceeeeeeeieeerriiiieeeeeeeeerrtriieeeeeeeeeererriieaaeeeeessessrrriaaaeeeaseees $0.00 per hour
Refundable Pavilion Key Deposit (Highland Glen) ...........cccoeeviiiiiiiiiiiiiieineiiieiiiiiiieeeeeeeees $50.00
Campground
Canyon Oaks
RESIARIIT et e et e et e et e e $25.00 per 24 hours
Non-Profit or Government Organizations ...........ccceeeeeeeveveiviiieeeeeeeeeeernreninnnnns $25.00 per 24 hours
6

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



JA o) o B =Y e 1= o X U PURRRR $50.00 per 24 hours

Highland Fling

Magazine Ad (Non-sponsor)

FULL PAGE ettt e e e e e e e e et e e e e e e e e ear b as $600.00
OMnE-NAlf PAGE....ceeeiiiii et e e e e e e e e e e ar $350.00
ONE-thITd PAZE..ceeiiiiiii ittt e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e et eeaaeeaarrr———as $225.00
O M- QUATEET PAZC.euvvuuneeeeeieieiiiiiie e e e e e ettt eaeeeeeeeeeettt i aaaeeaeesesaatbaaaaaeaesessssttnnaseeeessesssrnnnnnnns $150.00
OMNE-EIGNER PAGE.ccoviieiiiiiiicee e $100.00
Ad Design

FUlL pAGE (SIMPLE) ..unniiiiiiiiiiiiie e e et e e e e e et e e e e e e e e e aar e e e eaaaees $80.00
FUull page (COMPLEX).....coooviiiiiiiii et e e e et e e e e e e e vaa s $120.00
One-half page (SIMPLE) ...coooviviiiiieiiie e e e e e $40.00
One-half Page (COMPLEX) ....ovvviiiieiiieeiiieeecee et et e e e e e e e et eeeeeeeererrraaees $80.00
One-third Page (SIIMPLE) ......oouvuiieei it e e e e e et e e e e e e e ererr e es $30.00
One-third Page (COMPLEX) ....cuuuueeeiieeiiiieeiieee et ee e e et eeeee e e e e e eeeeeeererraaees $60.00
One-fourth Page (SIMPLE) .......uuueeiiiiiiiieeeeeee et e e e et e e e e e e e eeer s $20.00
One-fourth page (COMPLEX) ..o.uuuuiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e e et e e e e e e e et e e e e e e e e eearbranees $40.00
One-eighth page (SIMPLE) ...cooiiiiiiiiiiiice e e e e et e e e e e e e e e e es $20.00
One-eighth page (COMPLEX) ..oouuuiiiiiii e et e e e e e e eeer b es $40.00
Events

BK Early RegISTIAtION ......oovvviiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiiiee et e et e e e e e e e e et e eeeeeeeeesraaeees $15.00
BK Late REGISTIAtION ....cccoiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiieeiiceee e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e e ettt e e eeeeeeeaarrannes $25.00
5K On Site Registration (no shirt guaranteed)...........ccccceeeiiiiiien $30.00
1 Mile Fun Run Early Registration ..........cccccceeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeieee e eeenaee $10.00
1 Mile Fun Run Late Registration & On Site Registration .............cccccoceeiiiiiiin. $15.00
Baby Celebration .......cccoovviiiiiiiiieiiiiecee e e et e e e e e e et e e e e e e e aaaaaaes $12.00
Baby Celebration Late RegiStration .....cccciccciiiieiiiiiieeieeeiiiieiiieeee e eee e e e $15.00
Car SHOW WITH SHIET coieiiieieei ettt et e et e e e et e et e e e s eraeeeenas $20.00
Car SHoW WITROUD SHITT coeeuiiiiiiiie ettt et et e et e et e eaneseraeeeenas $10.00
Disc Golf Tournament Without Trilogy Set.........vveeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeieieeeieeee e $40.00
Disc Golf Tournament With Trilogy Set.........oouuuiiieiiiiiiiiiiiieee e $15.00
Disc Golf Tournament — Youth without Trilogy Set..........ccvveeeviiiiiiiiiiiiieeiieeeieiiieeeeeeeees $25.00
Disc Golf Tournament — Youth with Trilogy Set .......cccoeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii $10.00
Family Adventure RAcCe.......ccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii et e e $25.00
Strong Man ComPetitiOon ........uuueeiiieiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeee ettt ticeeeeeeeeeeeeaateeeeeeeeeeerartaaaeeeeeaseersrrraaeens $38.00
Utah State Hammer Championship & Highland Games..............oovvvviieeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeneeeee, $43.00
Strong Man Competition & Utah State Hammer Championship & Highland Games ...... $68.00
Hot Air Balloon Ride (tethered) ..........uuueeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieecceeeeeeeee et $5.00
Hot Air Balloon Ride (fLIZRt) .....coooiiiiiiiieiiiiiiieeeee e e $50.00
Kid’s Zone Pre-Registration ............ouuuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et e e e e e e e eaaees $20.00
Kid’s Zome Day Of .....coooiiiiiiiiieeee ettt e e e e e eeaaaees $22.00
KIA’'S Z0NE Pl RIAE .eeeeie et e e e eean $1.00-$5.00

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Parade Entry

Non-Highland BusSIneSS......uuuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiciee et e e e e e et eee e e e e e e e e eaabra s $200.00
Highland BuUSINESS ......oooviiiiiiiiii ettt e e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e eaabraes $100.00
NOD - RESIACIIT - oo e e eans $100.00
POT T I oIS e $25.00
Sports/Cheerleading TeaAIMIS .......ciii i i e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e eeeabaanns $25.00
Non-Parade — handing out flyers along parade route .........ccceeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeees $25.00
Sponsor/Church Group/School Group/Non-Profit/Government/Highland Resident............. $0.00
Sponsor

I LN oo ) o Tl ) SN $4,000.00
Diamond SPOTISOT ....iiiiieiiiiiie et et e e e e e $2,500.00
PLatinuIm SPOMSOT ..uuiiiiiiiiiiiciee et e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e $1,500.00
(€ 7Y Te ] o Yoy s T=To) BT PTTPRPURR $1,000.00
N Ry ) o To) s 1< o) PP RRUUURR $750.00
BrOmnzZe SPOMSOT . uvueeiiiieiieeeeeee et a e e e ————— $350.00
Friend of Highland FIINgG......cccoooooiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeece e =In-kind donations
Vendor (All Day)

NoON-Food Vendor RESIAIIT «....viveeieiee ittt ettt e et e et e e eaesetaeeeennes $50.00
Non-Food Vendor NON-RESIAGIIT ..ccuuuiieiiiie ettt et e e e e v eees $100.00
Non-Food Vendor Electricity OUtletS...ccoooiiiiiiiiiiiiiieieeeiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeee e $25.00/outlet
Non-Food Vendor NON-PIOIE..........ovvuiiieeiiieiiiieiiiieee ettt teee e e e e e e e et e eeeaaaees $25.00
Food Vendor ReSIAEN .......oviueiiiiiii ettt et e e ee $100.00
Food Vendor NON-ReSIAEINT .....covuiiiiiiii ettt e e $150.00
Food Vendor Electricity OUtlets..........uieiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeee e $50.00/outlet
Vendor (Evening only)

OO VIO . ettt et ettt e et e e e et e e e e taeeeaesetaeeeanas $25.00
Food Vendor Electricity OUtlets..........uieiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeceee e $10.00/outlet
JAN6) s B 2o Yo e BAVA=Y Ve Lo ) copr PO $10.00
Non-Food Vendor Electricity Outlets.....coooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiceie e $10.00/outlet

Justice Court
Fee schedule set by Utah State Legislature.

Library

Late BooK RELUIIL ...oooiviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiccee et e e e e e e eeeaaaan $0.10 per day
Late Movie, Kit or E-reader Return ..........c..oovviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiceee e $1.00 per day
Black and White Copies/Printing (1 S1de).........ccuuuvveeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeieeeeeeeen $0.10 per page
Color Copies/Printing (1 SIAE) ...ccieiiiiiiieiiiieeieeeiiieeeieeee e e e e aeees $0.50 per page
Annual Non-Resident Library Fee........coouvvuviiiiiiiiiiiieee e $70.00
Item Replacement Processing Fee ........oooiiviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiie e $5.00
PrOCEOTING SEIVICE ..uiiiiiiiiiiiieee e e e e e et e e e e e e e e e et e e eeeesereaaaeeeeaaaees $10.00
Interlibrary Loan ReqUESt.. ..ottt eeaeeees $5.00

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Miscellaneous

Returned Payment Fee ... e $20.00
Candidate FILING FEE .....ccooviiiiiiiii ittt e e e e e e e e aa s $35.00
Campaign Financial Disclosure Late Fee........cccccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiccie e $50.00
Surplus EQUIPMENt ...ccoooooiiiiiiiiiiiecieeeeeeeeeee e Cost determined by Staff
Community Garden Annual Box Rental (full growing season) ............cccceveeeeeeeeeriivvvvvnnnnne.. $40.00
Community Garden Annual Box Rental (after June 15)........cccoeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiineeieeiiiiiniinnn. $30.00
Community Garden Annual Box Rental (after August 1) .......ccooeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieneeeeiiiieiiinne. $20.00
(0701 11=Te3 o) o B 1Y N 18%
Credit Card Processing Fee (non-utility payments) ..........cooovviiiiienieiiiiiiiiiiciee e 3.00%

Planning and Zoning

Development

Accessory Dwelling Unit Application ......coeiieiiniiiiiiiiiiiii e e e e e e, $25.00
ANNexation APPLCATION . ......iiiiii e e e et e e e e e e e e e e e e e e $550.00
COoNAITIONAL USE PeIINIT . ccuuiieieiiieeiie ettt e et e e et e e taeeetaesetaeeeanesetaeeeannes $485.00
Co-locate Antenna APPLICAtION...........oviiiiiiiiiiii i e e e et e e e e e e e e eaa s $280.00
Architectural APPIOVAL......cooiiiiiiiiiiei et $575.00
Development Code Amendment AppliCation ........ccceeveeiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeiiiiiieeee e $1,000.00
Municipal Code Amendment AppliCation ..........eeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e e $500.00
General Plan Amendment AppliCation ...........couuvviiiiiieiiiiieiiiiiieeeeeeee e $1,000.00
Group HOme RevIeW . vt et e e e e e e ettt ete e e eraeneeneenaenss $485.00
Reasonable Accommodation APPliCation ...........ceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiie e e e e $25.00
Planned Development District APPliCation ........cceeeeviiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeieeeeeeee e $1,000.00
Plat AMendment Fee. ... .o e $550.00
Lot/Parcel ComBDINATION .......viiieiiii ettt et ettt et e e e et e et e e taaeesaeesaneennns $200.00
Parcel Boundary AdJustiment............oouvuieeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeee e $200.00
Right-of-way Vacation Application .........ccccceeiiiiiiiiiiii $200.00
Re-Z0onINg APPLICATION ..ovvveieiiiiiiiiieiiieeee et e e et e e e e e e e e e ea s $1,000.00
Site Plan ApPPLICATION........oovviiiiieeieiiiiiieeee ettt e e e e et eeeeeseerr s $725.00
Variance APPLICATION . ...cuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeieeeeeeee e e e e eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeereeeeeeeeeeeeeeeerereeseeeenrne $500.00
Appeal AUthOrity APPLICATION ...uvvueeiiiiiiiiiiieee et e e e e e eeeeeeaees $1,500.00
Town Center Exaction Fee..........ccccooiiiii, $1.50 per square foot
Subdivision Extension Application ...........cc.c.euen..... $62.50 per plat sheet plus $12.50 per lot
S1EN Permit...cccoiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiieeec e Based on Uniform Building Code
Temporary S1GIN Permiit..........coiiiiiiiiiiieieeeeiieiiiieee e eee ettt ceee e e eeeeeee it eeeeeeeeeeeeaaabaaaeeeeaeeessrraes $25.00

Subdivision Review and Engineering Base
Less than 10 Lots

Preliminary Plat Review — Engineer (2 reviews)........cooovvvviiiieieeeeeeiieiiiiieeeeeeeeeevvvvienee $2,250.00

Preliminary Plat Review — Staff (2 TeVIEWS)....oovvuiiieeeiiiiiiieeeee e $795.00

Final Plat Review & Recordation — Engineer (2 reviews) .....ccceeeeeeeeiieriviiiieeeeeeeeeererrinnnnnnns $450.00
10

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Final Plat Review & Recordation — Staff (2 reviews) ......oooovvveiiiiiiiieiiiiiiee e $779.00

Civil Review Fee — ENgineer (2 FEVIEWS) ...ceeieiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeatiieeeeeeeeseesnnnes $2,938.00
Civil Review Fee — Staff (2 TeVIEWS) c.oovvvuieeiiiiiiiieeeiee e $1,156.00
Construction Inspection Fee (Up to 185 hours).......ccceeeeieiiiiiieiiiiiiiee e $6,753.00
11-50 Lots

Preliminary Plat Review — Engineer (2 reViews)........ccoovvviiiiiieeeeeeiieiiiiiiee e $4,125.00
Preliminary Plat Review — Staff (2 FeVIEWS).....couvvuieeeiiiiiiiiieiiiee e $795.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Engineer (2 reviews) ......ccccoeeeeeeieeeeeiiieiiiieieieeeeeennnnns $450.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Staff (2 reVIieWs) .....coovvvvvieeiiiiiiiiieieeee e $779.00
Civil Review Fee — ENgineer (2 TEVIEWS) .u.ceeiiiiiiieeeiiiieeeeeeeeieeeriiieeeeeeeeeeeesriieeeeeeeeesernnnans $4,750.00
Civil Review Fee — Staff (2 TeVIEWS) ..oovvuuieeiiiiiiiieeeee e $1,156.00
Construction Inspection Fee (Up to 185 hours)........ccceeeeieieiiiieeiiiiieeeeeeeieeeieeeeeeeeeeeeeviaes $6,753.00

51-100 Lots

Preliminary Plat Review — Engineer (2 revViews)........ccoovvviiiiieiieeeeeiiiiiiiiceee e $5,500.00
Preliminary Plat Review — Staff (2 TeVIEWS).....oouuviieeiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e $795.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Engineer (2 reviews) .....ccoeeeeeieeiiireriiiieeeeeeeieveviiinnnns $450.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Staff (2 reviews) .......ocoovveviiiiieeiiiiiie e $779.00
Civil Review Fee — ENgineer (2 FEVIEWS) .uueeiiiiiiiiveiiiiieeeeeeeeieeeeiiieeeeeeeeeeeevrieeeeeeeesevnnnaes $8,000.00
Civil Review Fee — Staff (2 TeVIEWS) ...ccvvureeeiiiiiiiieeiiieeee et $1,156.00
Construction Inspection Fee (up to 185 hours).......cccceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiniiieeceeee e $6,753.00
101+ Lots

Preliminary Plat Review — Engineer (2 reVIiewWs)........cceivvvviiiiiieeeeeeiieiiiiiceee e e eeevvveeinnnns $7,250.00
Preliminary Plat Review — Staff (2 revVIeWs).......ouvuiieiiiiiiiiiiiiceeee e $795.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Engineer (2 reviews) .....ccoeeeeeieiiiieiiiiiieeeeeeeeieeiriiinnnen $450.00
Final Plat Review & Recordation — Staff (2 reVIeWs) ........ovvvvveeeiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeee $779.00
Civil Review Fee — ENgineer (2 F@VIEWS) ...cceeeeiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeevtiieeeeeeeeeeennenes $10,625.00
Civil Review Fee — Staff (2 TeVIEWS) ...couuviiieeiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e e $1,156.00
Construction Inspection Fee (up to 185 hours).........cccccuuuuiiiniiiiiiiiees $6,753.00

Subdivision Additional Reviews and Inspections
Less than 10 Lots

Preliminary Plat RevIiew (2 FEVIEWS) ..uueiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e e $3,045.00
Final Plat and Engineering Review (2 reVIEWS) ....ccccoeeeiiivviiiiiiieeeeeeeieiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeieenee $1,229.00
Civil ReVIEW FEE (2 TEVIEWS) .ovvvuiiiieiiiiiiiiiieee e e et e e e e e e e eeeeeeeeeeaeaaen $4,093.00
Construction Inspection Fee Hourly Rate .........cccovvvieeiiiiiiiiiiiii e $36.50
11-50 Lots
Preliminary Plat RevIiewW (2 FEVIEWS) ..uueeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee et $4,920.00
Final Plat and Engineering Review (2 reVIEWS) ...cccooeeeiiivviiiiiiiieeeeeeieiiiiieeeee e $1,229.00
Civil ReVIEW FEE (2 TEVIEWS) .ovvveeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e et ettt e e e e e e et eeeeeeeeeeaeaaen $5,906.00
Construction Inspection Fee Hourly Rate .........cccovviiieiiiiiiiiiiiii e $36.50
1

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



51-100 Lots

Preliminary Plat RevVIew (2 TEVIEWS) ..uuuciiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiie et e e e $6,295.00
Final Plat and Engineering Review (2 reVIEWS) ....ccooceeeiiivveiiiiiieeeeeeiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeevevrieeees $1,229.00
Civil ReVIEW FEE (2 TEVIEWS) .uvvuueiiieiiiieiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeieee e e eeeeeeeeateeeeeeeeeeeveateeeeeeeeeeereraaes $9,156.00
Construction Inspection Fee Hourly Rate .........ccccovvviiiiiiiiiiiii e, $36.50
101+ Lots

Preliminary Plat RevIiew (2 TEVIEWS) ..uuuciiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiie et e et $8,045.00
Final Plat and Engineering Review (2 reVIEWS) ....ccceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeiiiiieee e $1,229.00
Civil ReVIEW FEE (2 TEVIEWS) .uuvuneiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeee ettt iee e e e e e e et tieeeeeeeeeeeeataneeeeeeeeernnaaes $11,781.00
Construction Inspection Fee Hourly Rate .........ccccovviiiiiiiii e, $36.50
Miscellaneous

NI PllMIt. oo $25.00
Retaining Wall AppLiCation ..........couuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee et e e e ettt e e e e e e eeeab e e e eaaaeees $25.00
Public Utility Easement VACAtION. .......ceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee ettt e et eeeeeaaees $25.00
Open Space Purchase ...........cccccvveeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeens To be determined by City Council
Open Space Purchase Survey CoSsts .......cceeeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieieeeeeeeeiiccee e, To be paid by resident
Open Space Purchase Title Company Fees .........coovveeeiiiiiiiiiiiiineneiiiiiinnnnn. To be paid by resident
Maintenance Agreement APPliCAtION.........ooiiiiiiiiiiii i i $25.00

Public Works

TTEE SALE TrEES e i eiiiieeeeeee et e e e e e e e eaeaaes Actual cost to City
SATIADAZS e eiieeei et e e et e e e e e e r i ——aaaaaae $0.20 per bag
Hydrant APPLICATION ........ovuueeiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e et e e e e e e et et e e eeeeseeeaaaeeeeeaaaees $25.00
Hydrant Water Charge........ccoeoviiviiiiiiiiiieeieeeeeeeeieee e $1.00 per 1,000 gallons
Right-of-Way APPLICATION ..ueviiiiiiiiiiiiieec e e e e e e e et eeeeaeeees $250.00

Records Requests

COPY OF TECOTM ...cevvviiieiieeei et e e et e e e e e e e e s aab s $0.15/printed page
0T o VTSR Actual cost to City
Other costs allowed DY LW .........uuuuiiiiiiiiiiii e Actual cost to City
MiSCEllANEOUS COPYIIMEG .evvrruuieeeeeiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeittiieeeeeeeeeeerattreaaeeeeeeesrsrriaaaaaaaaeees $0.15/printed page
COPY OF TOPOTTS ..evviiiiiieeeeeei ettt e e e e et e e e e e e eee ettt e eeeeeeerasrannees $0.15/printed page
Electronic Copies (Tapes) of Meetings .....ccoeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeieeiiiiceeeeeeeeeevevriennn $30.00 per meeting
Interest charged on unpaid obligation due Highland City....................... 18% on unpaid balance
12

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Utility Charges

All fees are billed monthly except for Miscellaneous category
Garbage & Recycling

GATDAZE CANL cooiiiiiiiiii et e e et e e e e e e e et e aeeeatab— e aaaaaes $10.98
Additional Garbage Camn(8) .......cuuuuueiiiiiiiiiiiiiieiee e e e e e ettt ee e e e e e e e e e et e e aaeeaaaaaaas $7.72
RECTCIE CAN(S) wuuuiiiiiiiiieieci ettt et e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e e ettt e aaaeeaaaeraan $7.18
Culinary Water

Residential

Base (0-5,999 gallons of WALEE) .......cuuuveeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et ee e et e e e e e e eee e e eeeaaees $23.07
Overage (6,000-15,999 gallons of Water) ..........coevvvvrveeeeeeeeeieeerrinnnnn. $1.47 per thousand gallons
Overage (16,000+ gallons of Water) ..........ccccecvvvrrrrrvnrenrrenninenerennnnnnnns $3.85 per thousand gallons
Commercial

Base (0-5,999 gallons of WALEE) ......oouvueeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et e e e e e e et eeeeeaaees $48.07
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) ..........ovvveeeeeeeeiiiieiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeriinnn. $1.92 per thousand gallons
Churches and Schools

Base (0-5,999 gallons of Water) ........ouveiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et e e e et eaaaees $48.07
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) .........ccceeeeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiiieee e, $1.92 per thousand gallons
County Residents

Base (0-5,999 gallons of WALEE) ......couvuieeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et et e e e e e et eeeeaaaees $23.07
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) ..........veeeeeeeeiiiiieriiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeriinnn. $1.45 per thousand gallons
Industrial

Base (0-5,999 gallons of WALEE) .......cuvueeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeee et e e e e e e et eeeeaaaees $72.00
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) ..........ccceeeeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeiien. $2.47 per thousand gallons
Stock Watering

Base (0-5,999 gallons of Water) ........ouuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiie e e e e e e e eaaaees $23.07
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) ..........cccceeeeeeeeiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeienn. $1.47 per thousand gallons
10,000 rate

Base (0-5,999 gallons of WALEE) .......cuuueeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee et ee et e e e e e e e e e e eeaaaees $48.07
Overage (6,000+ gallons of Water) ...........vveeeeieeiiiiieiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeerinnn. $1.47 per thousand gallons
Pressurized Irrigation Water

5 72 T $24.14
Square Footage Rate ..........oovvviieeiiiiiiiiiieeeeeee e $0.000797 per square foot of lot
Non-Residential PI Rate......cccccoooooviiviiiiinnnnnnn.n. $0.000797 per square foot of permeable surface
Irrigation Water PUurchase ............ooovvvveeiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeceeeeeeen, $0.000814 per square foot of lot
Sewer

Residential

Gallon rate for sewer is calculated once a year based on an average of culinary water
consumption from October - April.
City Maintenance Base (9,999 gallons of Water) .....cceeeeviiiiiiiiiiiiiieeieeiiieeieeeeee e $7.15

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



City Maintenance Overage (10,000+ gallons of water) ...........cc......... $0.48 per thousand gallons
Timpanogos Special Service District (TSSD) Base (9,999 gallons of water) ........cccceee....... $32.77
TSSD Overage (10,000+ gallons of Water) .....ccccoceeevvveevriieeeeeeeeeeennnnn. $2.20 per thousand gallons

Businesses and Churches

Gallon rate for general commercial is calculated once a year in May based on an average of
culinary water consumption from October - April. Gallon rate for car washes is calculated once
a year in May based on an average monthly consumption for previous year.

City Maintenance Base (9,999 gallons of Water) .....ccccceeeeiiiiiiiriiiiiieeeeeiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeevees $8.68
City Maintenance Overage (10,000+ gallons of water) ...................... $0.48 per thousand gallons
Timpanogos Special Service District (TSSD) Base (9,999 gallons of water) ........ccceeeee..... $39.95
TSSD Overage (10,000+ gallons of Water) ......ccccceeeevveevviiieeeeeeeneeennnnn. $2.20 per thousand gallons
Schools
Rate is calculated once a year in September based on student enrollment.
City Maintenance Base ...........ueeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii e $0.1163612 per student
Timpanogos Special Service District (TSSD) ...cooeveiiiiiiiiiiiiiineiieiiiinn. $0.6593838 per student
Storm Drain
RESTIAINEIAL ..ottt et e et e et e et e e e e e taeeeeae s et e e eaesennaaeeas $9.76
Commercial .......cccoveeeeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieicceeeein, $0.00190 per square foot of the non-permeable surface
Other
Transportation (ROAd FE) ........ooovmriiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e $18.50
PUDIIC SOt @ ..uuniiiiiiiieeiee et $15.25
Miscellaneous
Utility Sign-up Processing Fee........veeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieei e $25.00
772 7 Y SRR 3%
SIUL-OFT TR .ottt e e e et e e s et e e eaeseanaaeees $80.00
Risk Account Deposit Fee.......cooovvmiiiieiiiiiiiiee e $250.00
| D=3 o TP PRPPPRTPI $100.00
Can Retrieval Fee (terminating service earlier than 12 months) .........ccccceeeiiiiiiiiiiiiinnnn.... $10.00
Can EXChange Fee ..ot $51.59
Can Overage Fee (after 2 written Warnings) ........ccccccceeeeeeeoiiiiionnnnnniiiinennnnnns $28.67
Service Reactivation Fee ... $28.67
Container Re-Delivery Fe ... $28.67
Replacement Container Fee .........oouiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee et $86.00
Contamination Fee (can used Inappropriately) .....cccoocoviiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeve $28.67
14

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023



Notes

It is not intended by any fee schedule Resolution to repeal, abrogate, annul, or in any way
impair or interfere with existing provisions of other resolutions, ordinances, or laws except to
effect modification of the fees reflected above. The fees listed in the Consolidated Fee Schedule
supersede present fees for services specified, but all fees not listed remain in effect. The most
recent Resolution imposing a higher fee than is imposed or required by existing provisions,
resolution, ordinance, or law, the provisions of that resolution shall control.

2024 Fee Schedule amended 11.1.2023, adopted 12.5.2023

15



